
Programming Module

Content Landing Page (Copy supplied
by Dakno)

Content Page (Copy supplied by
Dakno)

Provided by Client

Input By Client Post-launch

Form (form) Supplied by Dakno

Notes have been included (notes)

Key

MiniContact (form-mini-contact.php)

Privacy Policy (privacy.php)
Sitewide Elements

Content can be managed via the
Backdoor, including the ability to add
new pages.

Add/Edit/Remove Content

Attach notes to leads

Assign leads to individual people

All submitted forms will apear in the
Lead Management tool.

Lead Management

Add/Edit/Remove Staff

Multilevel user management

All Forms can be configured via the
Backdoor. This includes the notification
email address, the fields that are sent to
the user, and the copy within the
confirmation email.

Forms

Backdoor

Contact Us (contact.php)

Each Staff Member can have their own
page (such as Buyers Agents).

Staff Detail (staff-detailed.php)Staff (staff.php)

Testimonials (testimonial.php)

About Us (staff.php)

Interactive Google Mapping, Satellite
Imagery, and Google Street View *if
available in your area.

Neighborhood Map
(area-neighborhood-map.php)

Interactive Google Mapping, Satellite
Imagery, and Google Street View *if
available in your area.

Condo Detail (condo.php) Condo Map (condo.php)

Capability to Upload Unlimited Property
Photos, PDF's, and Text to Detail the
Listing Information.

Listing Detail (property-detail.php)

Interactive Google Mapping, Satellite
Imagery, and Google Street View *if
available in your area.

Google Mapping of Active Listings 

Request More Info
(request-more_info.php)

Request Showing
(request-showing.php)

Featured Listings (property-list.php)

Area Landing (area-info.php)
Interactive Area Map

Relocation Package Request
(form-relocation.php)

Content Page - Moving Tips (Copy
provided by Dakno)

Interactive Area Map- Shows
neighborhoods, condos and featured
properties entered by client

Relocation Landing (ourarea.php)
Copy provided by Dakno

Content Page-Staging Tips(Copy
provided by Dakno)

Home Valuation (form-cma.php)

Free Home Selling Guide
(form-selling-guide.php)

Neighborhood Sold Report
(form-neighborhood-sold-report.php)

Sellers Landing (sellers.php) Copy
provided by Dakno

Content Page-Buyer FAQ's (Copy
provided by Dakno)

Buying Guide (form-buying-guide.php)

Realtime Mortgage Calculator. Mortgage Calculator (buyers-calc.php)

Buyers Landing (buyers.php) Copy
provided by Dakno

Capability to Upload Unlimited Property
Photos, PDF's, and Text to Detail the
Listing Information.

Listing Detail (property-detail.php)

Interactive Google Mapping, Satellite
Imagery, and Google Street View *if
available in your area.

Google Mapping of Active Listings
(property-map.php)

Request More Info
(request-more_info.php)

Request Showing
(request-showing.php)

Featured Listings (property-list.php)

Client to provide MLS search link

Search Homes (idx-search.php)-
Client to provide IDX link

SwiftSite tm (index.php) Homepage
copy provided by Dakno


